IRWIN COUNTY, GEORGIA
2010 COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT BLOCK GRANT
GRANT NO. 10P-Y-077-1-5282
STREET AND DRAINAGE IMPROVEMENTS
CERTIFIED BID TABULATION
SWE Project No. 10-2651

B0 DTS JANUIARNY 2 0L (B UHIE: LML, Land Care Services, LLC. Littlefield Construction Company |Reeves Construction Company Ricketson Construction Company, Inc. Ross Construction Company
1513 Telfair Street 1518 Albany Avenue 2615 Old Jim Davis Road 822 RC Drive 3221 US hwy 41 South
Dublin, Georgia 31021 Waycross, Georgia 31503 Albany, Georgia 31707 Douglas, Georgia 31535 Tifton, Georgia 31794

ITEM NO DOLE')TEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
1 150.1000 | Traffic Control 1 LS $10,000.00 $10,000.00 $8,000.00 $8,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,000.00 $9,650.00 $9,650.00 $4,646.55 $4,646.55
2 162.1300 |Erosion Control Check Dams-Rip Rap 17 EA $90.00 $1,530.00 $150.00 $2,550.00 $210.00 $3,570.00 $50.00 $850.00 $100.00 $1,700.00
3 163.0232 | Temp Grassing 7.75 AC $600.00 $4,650.00 $100.00 $775.00 $100.00 $775.00 $35.00 $271.25 $0.01 $0.08
4 163.0240 |Mulch 22 TN $225.00 $4,950.00 $100.00 $2,200.00 $260.00 $5,720.00 $1.00 $22.00 $50.00 $1,100.00
5 163.0300 |Construction Exit 1 EA $1,200.00 $1,200.00 $900.00 $900.00 $2,000.00 $2,000.00 $850.00 $850.00 $1,373.54 $1,373.54
6 165.0030 |Maint T. Silt Fence Tp C 1,850 LF $0.50 $925.00 $0.10 $185.00 $0.01 $18.50 $0.01 $18.50 $0.20 $370.00
7 165.0040 |Maint. Of E.C. Ck Dams 17 EA $25.00 $425.00 $10.00 $170.00 $10.00 $170.00 $1.00 $17.00 $10.00 $170.00
8 165.0101 |Maint Const Exit 1 EA $450.00 $450.00 $50.00 $50.00 $100.00 $100.00 $1.00 $1.00 $44.04 $44.04
9 167.1000 |Water Q Mon. Samp 2 EA $250.00 $500.00 $10.00 $20.00 $265.00 $530.00 $150.00 $300.00 $105.00 $210.00
10 167.1500 |Water Quality Inspection 6 MO $800.00 $4,800.00 $100.00 $600.00 $105.00 $630.00 $150.00 $900.00 $787.50 $4,725.00
11 171.0030 | Temp Silt Fence Tp C 3,700 LF $3.00 $11,100.00 $0.50 $1,850.00 $3.50 $12,950.00 $2.00 $7,400.00 $3.03 $11,211.00
12 207-0203 |Found Backfill Matl, Tpll 165 cYy $12.00 $1,980.00 $5.00 $825.00 $45.00 $7,425.00 $40.00 $6,600.00 $10.00 $1,650.00
13 210.0100 |Grading Complete 1 LS $50,000.00 $50,000.00 $40,000.00 $40,000.00 $132,530.00 $132,530.00 $70,087.75 $70,087.75 $48,865.28 $48,865.28
14 |301.2140 ﬁz'r'ngecr';;;ab Bs Crs6 Inch (Including | 1g 365 | sy $1.97 $38,149.05 $2.28 $44,152.20 $2.80 $54,222.00 $2.70 $52,285.50 $3.66 $70,875.90
15 301.5000 |Portland Cement 395 TN $105.75 $41,771.25 $118.00 $46,610.00 $115.00 $45,425.00 $117.50 $46,412.50 $133.51 $52,736.45
16 318.3000 |Aggregate Surface Course 115 TN $25.50 $2,932.50 $20.00 $2,300.00 $22.00 $2,530.00 $22.00 $2,530.00 $5.00 $575.00
17 550-1180 [Storm Drain Pipe 18 Inch 72 LF $22.00 $1,584.00 $24.00 $1,728.00 $46.00 $3,312.00 $23.07 $1,661.04 $36.41 $2,621.52
18 550-1240 [Storm Drain Pipe 24 Inch 112 LF $28.85 $3,231.20 $28.50 $3,192.00 $50.00 $5,600.00 $30.39 $3,403.68 $42.34 $4,742.08
19 550-1330 |Storm Drain Pipe 30 Inch 32 LF $46.45 $1,486.40 $44.00 $1,408.00 $65.00 $2,080.00 $42.96 $1,374.72 $79.22 $2,535.04
20 550-1360 |Storm Drain Pipe 36 Inch 32 LF $61.00 $1,952.00 $58.00 $1,856.00 $77.00 $2,464.00 $55.91 $1,789.12 $91.06 $2,913.92
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(S0 DTS JANUIARNY 25 0L (B UIE: LN, Land Care Services, LLC. Littlefield Construction Company |Reeves Construction Company Ricketson Construction Company, Inc. Ross Construction Company
1513 Telfair Street 1518 Albany Avenue 2615 Old Jim Davis Road 822 RC Drive 3221 US hwy 41 South
Dublin, Georgia 31021 Waycross, Georgia 31503 Albany, Georgia 31707 Douglas, Georgia 31535 Tifton, Georgia 31794
ITEM NO DOL'OTEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
21 550-2180 [Side Drain Pipe 18 Inch, H 1-10 840 LF $22.00 $18,480.00 $24.00 $20,160.00 $24.00 $20,160.00 $23.07 $19,378.80 $33.11 $27,812.40
22 603.2181 |Stone Dump RipRap Tp3, 18 Inch 137 SsY $35.00 $4,795.00 $40.00 $5,480.00 $66.00 $9,042.00 $45.00 $6,165.00 $58.81 $8,056.97
23 603.7000 |Plastic Filter Fabric 137 SY $3.25 $445.25 $4.00 $548.00 $10.00 $1,370.00 $3.00 $411.00 $5.00 $685.00
24 636.1020 |Hwy Sign TP1-Sheet TP3 215 SF $12.00 $2,580.00 $11.50 $2,472.50 $14.50 $3,117.50 $7.50 $1,612.50 $14.70 $3,160.50
25 636.2070 |Galv Steel Post TP7 588 LF $4.75 $2,793.00 $5.50 $3,234.00 $6.25 $3,675.00 $2.79 $1,640.52 $6.30 $3,704.40
26 652.2501 |W. Solid Traff Stripe 5 Inch 3.02 LM $375.00 $1,132.50 $475.00 $1,434.50 $450.00 $1,359.00 $400.00 $1,208.00 $446.25 $1,347.68
27 652.2502 |Y. Solid Traff Stripe 5 Inch 3.02 LM $375.00 $1,132.50 $475.00 $1,434.50 $450.00 $1,359.00 $400.00 $1,208.00 $446.25 $1,347.68
28 652.5701 |W.Solid Traff Stripe 24 Inch 176 LF $5.00 $880.00 $4.00 $704.00 $2.65 $466.40 $4.00 $704.00 $2.63 $462.88
29 700-6910 [Permanent Grassing 3.87 AC $500.00 $1,935.00 $500.00 $1,935.00 $415.00 $1,606.05 $450.00 $1,741.50 $420.00 $1,625.40
30 700-8000 |Fertilizer, Mixed Grade 2.60 TN $500.00 $1,300.00 $500.00 $1,300.00 $520.00 $1,352.00 $350.00 $910.00 $525.00 $1,365.00
31 713-3012 [Wood Fiber Blankets, TP 11 18,720 SY $0.45 $8,424.00 $0.45 $8,424.00 $0.45 $8,424.00 $0.06 $1,123.20 $0.44 $8,236.80
32 999-7000 |Field Testing, Complete 1 LS $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $500.00 $500.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $3,000.00 $7,000.00 $7,000.00
33 999-9999 |Fencing Relocation 500 LF $5.00 $2,500.00 $3.00 $1,500.00 $6.75 $3,375.00 $4.00 $2,000.00 $5.51 $2,755.00
STREET AND DRAINAGE BASE BID $233,013.65 $208,497.70 $349,357.45 $247,526.58 $280,625.10
ALTERNATE "A" (ASPHALT OPTION), IF SO CHOSEN BY OWNER
AL [402-3113 Zﬁf}':gﬁ’;rgx&”&;fi’ug’ﬁ”ﬂf;’;a"e 1525 | TN $0.00 NO BID $76.00 $115,900.00 $74.25 $113,231.25 $77.38 $118,004.50 $78.74 $120,078.50
Pave Driveways back to Prescriptive Right-
A2 |402-9999 ‘(’:fogzd';‘:c”ydc'lne% ?;LE;TSE;E?;;;T 40 EA $0.00 NO BID $280.00 $11,200.00 $570.00 $22,800.00 $479.19 $19,167.60 $600.00 $24,000.00
Superpave Complete
TOTAL ALTERNATE "A" BID $0.00 $127,100.00 $136,031.25 $137,172.10 $144,078.50
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BID DTS JANUIARNY 2t 0L (B UHIE: LA, Land Care Services, LLC. Littlefield Construction Company |Reeves Construction Company Ricketson Construction Company, Inc. Ross Construction Company
1513 Telfair Street 1518 Albany Avenue 2615 Old Jim Davis Road 822 RC Drive 3221 US hwy 41 South
Dublin, Georgia 31021 Waycross, Georgia 31503 Albany, Georgia 31707 Douglas, Georgia 31535 Tifton, Georgia 31794
ITEM NO DOLE'JTEM DESCRIPTION UNIT QTY UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL UNIT PRICE TOTAL
ALTERNATE "B" (TRIPLE SURFACE TREATMENT OPTION), IF SO
CHOSEN BY OWNER
Bl |424-7089 gzpl'eof;”“e Treatment, Stn Size 6,7.889, | 15500 | sy $2.75 $50,875.00 $3.30 $61,050.00 $3.75 $69,375.00 $3.24 $59,940.00 $3.20 $59,200.00
Pave Driveways back to Prescriptive Right-
of-Way, Including Soil Cement Base, Pime
B2 402-9999 |Coat and Triple Surface Treatment, Stn Size 40 EA $350.00 $14,000.00 $142.00 $5,680.00 $525.00 $21,000.00 $416.13 $16,645.20 $600.00 $24,000.00
6,7, &89, Gp 1 or 2 Conc. 12.5mm
Superpave Complete

TOTAL ALTERNATE "B" BID $64,875.00 $66,730.00 $90,375.00 $76,585.20 $83,200.00

ADDITIVE BID NO. 1, IF SO CHOSEN BY OWNER

Al |441-6012 g"”cre‘e Curb & Gutter, 6 Inch x 24 Inch T 5 | ¢ $11.50 $23,000.00 $12.00 $24,000.00 $13.00 $26,000.00 $9.50 $19,000.00 $14.04 $28,080.00
TOTAL ADDITIVE NO.1 BID $23,000.00 $24,000.00 $26,000.00 $19,000.00 $28,080.00

TOTAL BASE BID W/ ALTERNATE "A" BID NO BID $335,597.70 $485,388.70 $384,698.68 $424,703.60

TOTAL BASE BID W/ ALTERNATE "B" BID $297,888.65 $275,227.70 $439,732.45 $324,111.78 $363,825.10

TOTAL BASE BID W/ ALTERNATE "A" AND ADDITIVE NO.1 BID NO BID $359,597.70 $511,388.70 $403,698.68 $452,783.60

TOTAL BASE BID W/ ALTERNATE "B BID AND ADDITIVENO.1BID |  $320,888.65 $299,227.70 $465,732.45 $343,111.78 $391,905.10

*Note: Land Care Services, LLC - No Letter of Bondability, Certificate of Liability Insurance, and Section 3 Form submitted per Bid Instructions.
*Note: Reeves Construction Company - No Letter of Bondability submitted per Bid Instructions.

*Note: Ricketson Construction Company had an error in the total for Line Item No.21. Submitted Total was $19,373.80. Corrected Total with Bid Tabulation is $19,378.80. Difference of $5.00. Also, Total Base Bid "'Total** had an error. Submitted Base
Bid Total was $247,826.58. Corrected Total with Bid Tabulation is $247,526.58. Difference of $300.00. No Section 3 Form was submitted as per Bid Instructions.
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